Port of Houston Authority Evaluation Form for CSB
Project: CSB -206 Purchase Tires for RTG Cranes and Terminal Equipment at Barbours Cut, Bayport Container and Turning Basin Terminals

Date: 2/14/2017 @ 4:00 P.M.

Items 1-45
Estimate:$1,800,000 CSB SELECTION CRITERIA
1 2 3
Is Contractor Otherwise
Small Business Goal Met? Deemed a Responsible
Vendor Bid Amount Bidder? Comments
YorN
YorN
T&W Tire LLC 1. Responsible bidder with lowest price.
5300 Lone Star Blvd. $796,108.42 N/A Y 2. Bid on all available items.
Fort Worth, TX 76106 3. All brands identified.
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 1. Responsible bidder with second lowest price.
800 Hig_hway 98 $855,683.00 N/A Y 2. Bid on all available items.
Columbia, MS 39429 3. All brands identified.
Beasley Tire Service - Houston, Inc. 1. Responsible bidder with third lowest price.
11802 Eastex Freeway $902,926.64 N/A Y 2. Bid on all available items.
Houston, TX 77039 3. Some brands not identified.
Bridgestone Americas Tire Operations, LLC 1. Responsible bidder with fourth lowest price.
dba GCR Tire Service 2. Bid on all available items.
299 Gellhom $927,720.64 NIA Y 3. All brands identified.
Houston, TX 77013
Goodyear Commercial Tire & Service Centers 1. Responsible bidder with fifth lowest price.
4411 Homestead Road 2. Bid on all available items.
Houston, TX 77028 $1,012,695.58 N/A Y 3. Some brands listed as ‘various'.

NON RESPONSIVE

A responsible Bidder should:

Have a satisfactory references; and

o0~ wN P

Meet the applicable small business participation requirements, if any
Have the ability to comply with the required delivery or performance schedule, taking into consideration other business commitments;
Have a satisfactory record of performance and integrity;

Have a satisfactory safety and environmental record;
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Have the necessary facilities, organization, experience, authorizations, technical skills, and financial resources to fulfill the terms of the contract for the Project.

FOR ED AND PORT COMMISSION ONLY



Port of Houston Authority Evaluation Form for CSB
Project: CSB -206 Purchase Tires for RTG Cranes and Terminal Equipment at Barbours Cut, Bayport Container and Turning Basin Terminals

Date: 2/14/2017 @ 4:00 P.M.

Item 46

Estimate:$1,800,000 CSB SELECTION CRITERIA

1 2 3

Is Contractor Otherwise
Small Business Goal Met? Deemed a Responsible
Vendor Bid Amount Bidder? Comments
YorN
YorN
Beasley Tire Service - Houston, Inc. 1. Responsible bidder with lowest price.
11802 Eastex Freeway $96,868.00 N/A Y 2. Bid on all available items.
Houston, TX 77039 3. All brands identified.
T&W Tire LLC 1. Responsible bidder with second lowest price.
5300 Lone Star Blvd. $105,000.00 N/A Y 2. Bid on all available items.
Fort Worth, TX 76106 3. All brands identified.
NON RESPONSIVE

Bridgestone Americas Tire Operations, LLC Did not meet the full requirement for the project scope.
dba GCR Tire Service )
299 Gellhorn No Bid N/A Y
Houston, TX 77013
Goodyear Commercial Tire & Service Centers Did not meet the full requirement for the project scope.
4411 Homestead Road
Houston, TX 77028 No Bid N/A Y
Southern Tire Mart, LLC Did not meet the full requirement for the project scope.
800 Highway 98 No Bid N/A Y

Columbia, MS 39429

A responsible Bidder should:

Have a satisfactory references; and
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Meet the applicable small business participation requirements, if any
Have the ability to comply with the required delivery or performance schedule, taking into consideration other business commitments;
Have a satisfactory record of performance and integrity;

Have a satisfactory safety and environmental record;
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Have the necessary facilities, organization, experience, authorizations, technical skills, and financial resources to fulfill the terms of the contract for the Project.

FOR ED AND PORT COMMISSION ONLY




Port of Houston Authority Evaluation Form for CSB
Project: CSB -206 Purchase Tires for RTG Cranes and Terminal Equipment at Barbours Cut, Bayport Container and Turning Basin Terminals
Date: 2/14/2017 @ 4:00 P.M.

Item 47
Estimate:$1,800,000 CSB SELECTION CRITERIA
1 2 3
Is Contractor Otherwise
Small Business Goal Met? Deemed a Responsible
Vendor Bid Amount Bidder? Comments
YorN
YorN
T&W Tire LLC 1. Responsible bidder with lowest price.
5300 Lone Star Blvd. $502,143.00 N/A Y 2. Bid on all available items.
Fort Worth, TX 76106 3. All brands identified.
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 1. Responsible bidder with second lowest price.
800 Hig_hway 98 $522,000.00 N/A Y 2. Bid on all available items.
Columbia, MS 39429 3. All brands identified.
Beasley Tire Service - Houston, Inc. 1. Responsible bidder with third lowest price.
11802 Eastex Freeway $534,600.00 N/A Y 2. Bid on all available items.
Houston, TX 77039 3. All brands identified.
Bridgestone Americas Tire Operations, LLC 1. Responsible bidder with fourth lowest price.
dba GCR Tire Service 2. Bid on all available items.
299 Gellhon $570,000.00 NIA Y 3. All brands identified.
Houston, TX 77013
NON RESPONSIVE
Goodyear Commercial Tire & Service Centers Did not meet the full requirement for the project scope.
4411 Homestead Road No Bid N/A Y

Houston, TX 77028

In determining whether a bidder qualifies as “responsible” (i.e., eligible for award), a number of factors, including but not limited to the following, may be considered.

A responsible Bidder should:

Have a satisfactory references; and
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Meet the applicable small business participation requirements, if any
Have the ability to comply with the required delivery or performance schedule, taking into consideration other business commitments;
Have a satisfactory record of performance and integrity;

Have a satisfactory safety and environmental record;

Page 30f 4

Have the necessary facilities, organization, experience, authorizations, technical skills, and financial resources to fulfill the terms of the contract for the Project.

FOR ED AND PORT COMMISSION ONLY



Port of Houston Authority Evaluation Form for CSB
Project: CSB -206 Purchase Tires for RTG Cranes and Terminal Equipment at Barbours Cut, Bayport Container and Turning Basin Terminals
Date: 2/14/2017 @ 4:00 P.M.

Items 48-50
Estimate:$1,800,000 CSB SELECTION CRITERIA
1 2 3
Is Contractor Otherwise
Small Business Goal Met? | Deemed a Responsible
Vendor Bid Amount Bidder? Comments
YorN
YorN
Beasley Tire Service - Houston, Inc. $83.970.00 1. Responsible bidder with lowest price.
11802 Eastex Freeway Line | y 5(') onl N/A Y 2. Bid on one of three available items.
Houston, TX 77039 ine Item 50 Only 3. Al brands identified.
T&W Tire LLC 1. Responsible bidder with second lowest price.
5300 Lone Star Blvd. $276,780.00 N/A % 2. Bid on all available items.
Fort Worth, TX 76106 3. All brands identified.
Southern Tire Mart, LLC 1. Responsible bidder with third lowest price.
800 Hig_hway 98 $295,000.00 N/A Y 2. Bid on all available items.
Columbia, MS 39429 3. All brands identified.
Bridgestone Americas Tire Operations, LLC 1. Responsible bidder with fourth lowest price.
dba GCR Tire Service 2. Bid on all available items.
299 Gellhorn $307,500.00 N/A Y 3. All brands identified.
Houston, TX 77013
NON RESPONSIVE
Goodyear Commercial Tire & Service Centers Did not meet the full requirement for the project scope.
4411 Homestead Road No Bid N/A Y

Houston, TX 77028

In determining whether a bidder qualifies as “responsible” (i.e., eligible for award), a number of factors, including but not limited to the following, may be considered.

A responsible Bidder should:

Have a satisfactory references; and
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Meet the applicable small business participation requirements, if any
Have the ability to comply with the required delivery or performance schedule, taking into consideration other business commitments;
Have a satisfactory record of performance and integrity;
Have a satisfactory safety and environmental record;
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Have the necessary facilities, organization, experience, authorizations, technical skills, and financial resources to fulfill the terms of the contract for the Project.

FOR ED AND PORT COMMISSION ONLY
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